Number 37 of 2023

Social Welfare (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023







Number 37 of 2023

SOCIAL WELFARE (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT 2023

CONTENTS

PART 1
PRELIMINARY AND GENERAL

Section
1. Short title, construction and commencement

2. Definitions

PART 2
AMENDMENTS OF SOCIAL WELFARE ACTS

Amendment of section 13 of Principal Act — employment contributions
Maternity benefit — new rate

Adoptive benefit — new rate

Paternity benefit — new rate

Parent’s benefit — amendment of duration of benefit

Parent’s benefit — new rate

L ® =N AW

Increase in rates of jobseeker’s benefit and jobseeker’s benefit (self-employed) relating
to certain reckonable weekly earnings, certain weekly income and certain
reckonable weekly income and certain periods

10. Amendment of section 119 of Principal Act

11. Amendment of section 141 of Principal Act (entitlement to jobseeker’s allowance)
12. Increase for qualified children

13. Amendment of section 219 of Principal Act

14. Working family payment

15. Amendment of section 290 of Principal Act

16. Amendment of section 300 of Principal Act

17. Social insurance benefits — new rates

18. Amendment of Schedule 3 to Principal Act

19. Social assistance payments — new rates

20. Domiciliary care allowance — new rate



[No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]

21.
22.
23.
24.
25.
26.
27.

28.

(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

PART 3
StatuTORY SicK Pay

Amendment of section 5 of Sick Leave Act 2022
Amendment of Schedule 6 to Workplace Relations Act 2015
Amendment of section 2 of Principal Act

Illness benefit (entitlement to benefit)

Illness benefit (conditions for receipt)

Illness benefit (duration of payment)

Amendment of section 69 of Principal Act (occupational injuries benefits) - calculation
of period in definition of “injury benefit period”

Occupational injuries benefits

PART 4

StaTE PENSION (CoNTRIBUTORY) — LONG-TERM CARER’S QUALIFYING CONTRIBUTION AND DEFERRAL OF

29

30.

31.
32.

33.
34.

35.
36.
37.
38.
39.
40.

41.
42.

43.

44.

45.

StaTE PENSION (CONTRIBUTORY)

Amendment of section 2 of Principal Act

Amendment of section 12 of Principal Act (employed contributors and insured
persons)

Amendment of section 13 of Principal Act (employment contributions)

Amendment of section 20 of Principal Act (self-employed contributors and insured
persons)

Amendment of section 24 of Principal Act (voluntary contributors)

Amendment of section 25 of Principal Act (voluntary contributions by former
employed contributors)

Amendment of section 40 of Principal Act (entitlement to illness benefit)
Amendment of section 44 of Principal Act (duration of illness benefit)

Amendment of section 46A of Principal Act (entitlement to partial capacity benefit)
Amendment of section 46C of Principal Act (duration of partial capacity benefit)
Amendment of section 62 of Principal Act (entitlement to jobseeker’s benefit)

Amendment of section 64 of Principal Act (conditions for receipt of jobseeker’s
benefit)

Amendment of section 67 of Principal Act (duration of payment of jobseeker’s benefit)

Amendment of section 68C of Principal Act (entitlement to jobseeker’s benefit (self-
employed))

Amendment of section 68H of Principal Act (duration of jobseeker’s benefit (self-
employed))

Amendment of section 108 of Principal Act (entitlement to State pension
(contributory))

Long-term carer’s qualifying contribution



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

46. Amendment of section 109 of Principal Act (conditions for receipt of State pension
(contributory))

47. Amendment of section 110 of Principal Act
48. Rate of pension
49. Amendment of section 113A of Principal Act

50. Amendment of section 238B of Principal Act (entitlement to back to work family
dividend)

51. Amendment of section 238C of Principal Act (duration of back to work family
dividend)

52. Amendment of Part 1 of Schedule 2 to Principal Act
53. Specified weekly payments

SCHEDULE 1

SociaL Insurance Benerits (NEw RaTes) - SussTiTuTION OF PaRTS 1 TO 4 OF SCHEDULE 2

SCHEDULE 2

SocraL AssisTANCE PayMENTS (NEw RaTES) - SussTiTuTioN oF PaRTS 1 TO 3 OF ScHEDULE 4



[No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

Acts REFERRED TO

Credit Union Act 1997 (No. 15)

Medical Practitioners Act 2007 (No. 25)

Sick Leave Act 2022 (No. 24)

Social Welfare Act 2021 (No. 44)

Social Welfare Act 2022 (No. 43)

Social Welfare Consolidation Act 2005 (No. 26)

Social Welfare, Pensions and Civil Registration Act 2018 (No. 37)
Workplace Relations Act 2015 (No. 16)



Number 37 of 2023

SOCIAL WELFARE (MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT 2023

An Act to amend and extend the Social Welfare Acts; to amend the Sick Leave Act 2022
and the Workplace Relations Act 2015; to make provision for the attribution, in certain
circumstances, for the purposes of the State pension (contributory), of contributions by
certain persons who provide long-term care and attention to certain other persons and
for the deferral, on a voluntary basis, by certain persons in certain circumstances in
accessing the State pension (contributory) and for the phased transition to the total
contributions approach in relation to the calculation of the State pension (contributory)
and, for those and other purposes, to further amend and extend the Social Welfare Acts;
and to provide for related matters. [14th December, 2023]

Be it enacted by the Oireachtas as follows:

PART 1

PRELIMINARY AND (GENERAL

Short title, construction and commencement
1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Social Welfare (Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(2) The Social Welfare Acts and this Act (other than sections 21 and 22) shall be
construed together as one Act.

(3) Sections 3, 4, 5, 6, 8 and 20, Part 3 and Part 4 (other than section 52) come into
operation on 1 January 2024.

(4) Section 15(b) comes into operation on such day or days as the Minister for Social
Protection may appoint by order or orders either generally or with reference to any
particular purpose or provision, and different days may be so appointed for different
purposes or different provisions.

Definitions
2. In this Act—

“Act of 2022 means the Social Welfare Act 2022;

“Principal Act” means the Social Welfare Consolidation Act 2005.



[No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

PART 2

AMENDMENTS OF SOCIAL WELFARE ACTS

Amendment of section 13 of Principal Act — employment contributions
3. Section 13 of the Principal Act is amended, in subsection (4A), by the substitution of the
following paragraph for paragraph (a):

“(a) the exercise, on or before 31 December 2023, of a right in
accordance with section 128 of the Act of 1997, or”.

Maternity benefit — new rate

4. Section 49(1) (amended by section 5 of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is amended,
in paragraph (b), by the substitution of the following subparagraph for subparagraph (ii):

“(ii) €274.”.

Adoptive benefit — new rate

5. Section 60(1) (amended by section 6 of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is amended,
in paragraph (b), by the substitution of the following subparagraph for subparagraph (ii):

“(i1) €274.”.

Paternity benefit — new rate

6. Section 61D (amended by section 7 of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is amended,
by the substitution of the following paragraph for paragraph (b):

“(b) €274.”.

Parent’s benefit — amendment of duration of benefit

7. (1) Section 61G(10) (amended by section 8 of the Social Welfare Act 2021) of the
Principal Act is amended—

(a) in paragraph (b)(i), by the substitution of “9 consecutive weeks” for “seven
consecutive weeks”,

(b) in paragraph (b)(ii), by the substitution of “9 consecutive weeks” for “seven
consecutive weeks”, and

(c) in paragraph (c), by the substitution of “9 weeks” for 7 weeks”.

(2) This section comes into operation on 1 August 2024.

Parent’s benefit — new rate

8. Section 611 (amended by section 8 of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is amended,
by the substitution of the following paragraph for paragraph (b):

6



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.2 S.8
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

“(b) €274.”.

Increase in rates of jobseeker’s benefit and jobseeker’s benefit (self-employed) relating to
certain reckonable weekly earnings, certain weekly income and certain reckonable weekly
income and certain periods

9. (1) Section 65A(1) (amended by section 9(1) of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is
amended—

(a) in paragraphs (a), (d) and (g), by the substitution of “€104.10” for “€98.70” in
each place where it occurs,

(b) in paragraphs (b), (e) and (h), by the substitution of “€149.60” for “€141.90” in
each place where it occurs, and

(c) in paragraphs (c), (f) and (i), by the substitution of “€181.70” for “€172.30” in
each place where it occurs.

(2) Section 65A(2) (amended by section 9(2) of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is
amended—

(a) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “€84.30” for “€78.90”,
(b) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “€121.20” for “€113.50”, and
(c) in paragraph (c), by the substitution of “€147.20” for “€137.80”.

(3) Section 66(1A) (amended by section 9(3) of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is
amended, by the substitution of “€99.70” for “€94.50”.

(4) Section 68F(1) (amended by section 9(4) of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is
amended—

(a) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “€104.10” for “€98.70”,
(b) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “€149.60” for “€141.90”, and
(c) in paragraph (c), by the substitution of “€181.70” for “€172.30”.

(5) Section 68F(2) (amended by section 9(5) of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is
amended—

(a) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “€84.30” for “€78.90”,
(b) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “€121.20” for “€113.50”, and
(c) in paragraph (c), by the substitution of “€147.20” for “€137.80”.

(6) Section 68G(2) (amended by section 9(6) of the Act of 2022) of the Principal Act is
amended, by the substitution of “€99.70” for “€94.50.

(7) This section comes into operation on 28 December 2023.

Amendment of section 119 of Principal Act
10.  Section 119 of the Principal Act is amended, in subsection (3)(b), by the substitution of

7



P1.2 S.10 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

“illness benefit” for “disability benefit”.

Amendment of section 141 of Principal Act (entitlement to jobseeker’s allowance)

11.  Section 141 of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
subsection for subsection (3B):

“(3B) Notwithstanding subsection (3), for the purposes of payment of
jobseeker’s allowance, in subsection (3A), ‘payment week’ shall be
construed as a 6 day week commencing on the Wednesday of one
week and ending on the Tuesday of the following week.”.

Increase for qualified children
12. (1) The Principal Act is amended—

(a) in section 156(1) (amended by section 17 of, and Schedule 1 to, the Act of
2018)—

(i) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “Schedule 4” for “Schedule 2”, and
(i1) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “Schedule 4” for “Schedule 27,

(b) in section 161B(1) (amended by section 17 of, and Schedule 1 to, the Act of
2018)—

(i) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “Schedule 4” for “Schedule 2”, and
(i1) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “Schedule 4” for “Schedule 27,
and

(c) in section 174(1) (amended by section 17 of, and Schedule 1 to, the Act of
2018)—

(i) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “Schedule 4” for “Schedule 2”, and
(i1) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “Schedule 4” for “Schedule 2”.

(2) In this section, “Act of 2018” means the Social Welfare, Pensions and Civil
Registration Act 2018.

Amendment of section 219 of Principal Act
13. (1) Section 219(1) of the Principal Act is amended, in paragraph (b), by the substitution
of “19 years” for “18 years”.

(2) This section comes into operation on 3 September 2024.

Working family payment

14. (1) The Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following section for
section 228:



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.2 S.14
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

“228. Subject to this Act, an allowance (in this Act referred to as ‘working
family payment’) shall be payable out of moneys provided by the
Oireachtas in respect of a family where the weekly family income is less
than—

(a) in the case of a family which includes only 1 child, €645,

(b) in the case of a family which includes 2 children, €746,

(c) in the case of a family which includes 3 children, €847,

(d) in the case of a family which includes 4 children, €938,

(e) in the case of a family which includes 5 children, €1,064,

(f) in the case of a family which includes 6 children, €1,180,

(g) in the case of a family which includes 7 children, €1,316, or

(h) in the case of a family which includes 8 or more children, €1,412.”.

(2) This section comes into operation on 4 January 2024.

Amendment of section 290 of Principal Act
15.  Section 290 of the Principal Act is amended, in subsection (3B)—

(a) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “€5,000” for “€2,000”,
(b) by the substitution of the following paragraph for paragraph (c):

“(c) the interest rate charged in respect of such borrowings, the
maximum amount of which shall not exceed the interest rate
specified by the Minister for Finance in an order under
section 38(3) of the Credit Union Act 1997,”,

(c) in paragraph (d), by the substitution of “borrowings, and” for “borrowings.”, and
(d) by the insertion of the following paragraph after paragraph (d):

“(e) the discharge, by the Minister, of any transaction fee, which shall
not exceed €0.50 per transaction, in respect of which repayments in
relation to borrowings under this section are to be made by a
beneficiary.”.

Amendment of section 300 of Principal Act
16.  Section 300 of the Principal Act is amended, in subsection (10)—

(a) by the substitution of “whether State pension (contributory)” for “whether old
age (contributory) pension”, and

(b) by the substitution of “receive a State pension (contributory)” for “receive an old
age (contributory) pension”.



Pr.2 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

Social insurance benefits — new rates

17. (1) Schedule 2 (amended by section 13 of the Act of 2022) to the Principal Act is
amended, by the substitution of the Parts set out in Schedule I for Parts 1 to 4 of
Schedule 2 to the Principal Act.

(2) This section comes into operation—

a) in so far as it relates to jobseecker’s benefit and jobseeker’s benefit
i f: i 1 jobseeker’s benefi d jobseeker’s benefi
(self-employed), on 28 December 2023,

(b) in so far as it relates to—
(1) illness benefit,
(i) health and safety benefit, and
(iii) injury benefit,
on 1 January 2024,
(c) in so far as it relates to—
(i) carer’s benefit,
(i1) invalidity pension, and

(iii)) a payment referred to in paragraph (a) of the definition of “relevant
payment” in section 178(1) of the Principal Act,

on 4 January 2024, and
(d) in so far as it relates to—
(i) death benefit under Chapter 13 (other than section 84) of the Principal Act,

(i1)) widow’s (contributory) pension,
(iii)) widower’s (contributory) pension,
(iv) surviving civil partner’s (contributory) pension,
(v) State pension (contributory),
(vi) guardian’s payment (contributory),

(vii) disablement pension, and

(viii) disablement gratuity,

on 5 January 2024.

Amendment of Schedule 3 to Principal Act

18. Schedule 3 to the Principal Act is amended, in Rule 1A(2) of Part 4, by the substitution
of “pensionable age” for “the age of 65 years”.

10



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.2
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

Social assistance payments — new rates

19. (1) Schedule 4 (amended by section 15 of the Act of 2022) to the Principal Act is

amended, by the substitution of the Parts set out in Schedule 2 for Parts 1 to 3 of
Schedule 4 to the Principal Act.

(2) This section comes into operation—

(a) in so far as it relates to—

(i) jobseeker’s allowance (other than where payable in accordance with section
148A of the Principal Act), and

(i) farm assist,

on 27 December 2023,
(b) in so far as it relates to supplementary welfare allowance, on 1 January 2024,
(c) in so far as it relates to disability allowance, on 3 January 2024,

(d) in so far as it relates to—

(i) one-parent family payment (other than where payable in respect of a widow,
widower or surviving civil partner),

(i) jobseeker’s allowance payable in accordance with section 148A of the
Principal Act,

(iii) a payment referred to in paragraph (b) or (c) of the definition of “relevant
payment” in section 178(1) of the Principal Act, and

(iv) carer’s allowance,
on 4 January 2024, and
(e) in so far as it relates to—
(1) State pension (non-contributory),
(i) blind pension,
(ii1) guardian’s payment (non-contributory),
(iv) widow’s (non-contributory) pension,
(v) widower’s (non-contributory) pension,
(vi) surviving civil partner’s (non-contributory) pension, and

(vii) one-parent family payment (payable in respect of a widow, widower or
surviving civil partner),

on 5 January 2024.

Domiciliary care allowance — new rate

20. Part 5 of Schedule 4 (amended by section 16 of the Act of 2022) to the Principal Act is

11



Pr1.2 S.20 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

amended, by the substitution of “€340.00” for “€330.00”.

PART 3

StaTUTORY SIcK PAY

Amendment of section 5 of Sick Leave Act 2022
21. Section 5 of the Sick Leave Act 2022 is amended—

(a) in subsection (4), by the substitution of “Subject to subsection (4A), the first day”
for “The first day”,

(b) by the insertion of the following subsection after subsection (4):

“(4A) An employee shall not be entitled to statutory sick leave where, on the
immediately preceding normal working day, that employee was on sick
leave—

(a) constituting statutory sick leave in the immediately previous
calendar year, or

(b) for which the employee was entitled to illness benefit or injury
benefit.”,

and
(c) by the substitution of the following subsection for subsection (10):
“(10) In this section—
‘Act of 2005° means the Social Welfare Consolidation Act 2005;

‘illness benefit’ has the same meaning as it has in Chapter 8 of Part 2
of the Act of 2005;

‘injury benefit’ has the same meaning as it has in Chapter 13 of Part 2
of the Act of 2005;

‘normal working day’ means any day which the employee would
ordinarily work for his or her employer if the employee had not been
incapable of doing so due to illness or injury;

‘registered medical practitioner’ has the same meaning as it has in the
Medical Practitioners Act 2007.”.

Amendment of Schedule 6 to Workplace Relations Act 2015
22.  Schedule 6 to the Workplace Relations Act 2015 is amended—

(a) in paragraph 38 of Part 1, by the substitution of “Section 14” for “Section 127,
and

12



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.3 S.22
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(b) in paragraph 38 of Part 2, by the substitution of “Section 14” for “Section 12”.

Amendment of section 2 of Principal Act

23.  Section 2 of the Principal Act is amended, in subsection (1), by the insertion of the
following definitions:

““Act of 2022’ means the Sick Leave Act 2022;

‘sick leave scheme’ has the meaning given to it by section 9 of the Act
0f 2022;

‘statutory sick leave’ has the meaning given to it by section 2 of the
Act of 2022;

‘statutory sick leave day’ has the meaning given to it by section 2 of
the Act 0of 2022;”.

Illness benefit (entitlement to benefit)

24,  Section 40 of the Principal Act is amended—
(a) by the insertion of the following subsections after subsection (2A):

“(2B) Notwithstanding subsections (2) and (2A), a person shall not be
entitled to illness benefit—

(a) for any day in respect of which the person is entitled to statutory
sick leave under the Act of 2022, or

(b) for any day in respect of which the person, where he or she is
otherwise entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 is,
instead of and in substitution for that entitlement to the statutory
sick leave days concerned, being provided by his or her employer
with a sick leave scheme under the Act of 2022.

(2C) Subsection (2B) shall not apply in a case where an exemption is for
the time being in force under section 10 of the Act of 2022 in respect
of the employer of the person concerned.

(2D) Notwithstanding subsections (2), (2A) and (2B), a person shall not be
entitled to illness benefit for the first day of any such entitlement,
where in the immediately preceding 6 days the person is entitled to
statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 in respect of a Sunday.”,

and
(b) in subsection (3), by the insertion of the following paragraph after paragraph (ea):

“(eb) for the purpose of paragraph (ea), in calculating the total of 624
days, the following days shall, in addition to any days in respect of
which the person was in receipt of illness benefit, be included in
the calculation:

13



P1.3 S.24 [No. 37.]

Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(1) any statutory sick leave days under the Act of 2022, other than
the first 3 days of such sick leave;

(i1) any day in respect of which the person, where he or she is
otherwise entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022
is, instead of and in substitution for that entitlement to the
statutory sick leave days concerned, being provided by his or
her employer with a sick leave scheme under the Act of 2022,
other than the first 3 days of payment under such scheme.”.

Illness benefit (conditions for receipt)

25.  Section 41 of the Principal Act is amended, by the insertion of the following subsection
after subsection (5A):

“(5B) For the purpose of subsection (5), in calculating the total of 312 days,

the following days shall, in addition to any days in respect of which
the person was in receipt of illness benefit, be included in the
calculation:

(a) any statutory sick leave days under the Act of 2022, other than the

first 3 days of such sick leave;

(b) any day in respect of which the person, where he or she is

otherwise entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 is,
instead of and in substitution for that entitlement to the statutory
sick leave days concerned, being provided by his or her employer
with a sick leave scheme under the Act of 2022.”.

Iliness benefit (duration of payment)
26. Section 44 of the Principal Act is amended—

(a) by the insertion of the following subsection after subsection (1D):

“(1E) For the purpose of subsection (1), in calculating the total of 312 days

and

the following days shall, in addition to any days in respect of which
the person was in receipt of illness benefit, be included in the
calculation:

(a) any statutory sick leave days under the Act of 2022, other than the

first 3 days of such sick leave;

(b) any day in respect of which the person, where he or she is

otherwise entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 is,
instead of and in substitution for that entitlement to the statutory
sick leave days concerned, being provided by his or her employer
with a sick leave scheme under the Act of 2022, other than the first
3 days of payment under such scheme.”,

14



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.3 S.26
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(b) by the insertion of the following subsection after subsection (7A):

“(7B) for the purpose of subsection (7), in calculating the 312th day, the
following days shall, in addition to any days in respect of which the
person was in receipt of illness benefit, be included in the calculation:

(a) any statutory sick leave days under the Act of 2022, other than the
first 3 days of such sick leave;

(b) any day in respect of which the person, where he or she is
otherwise entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 is,
instead of and in substitution for that entitlement to the statutory
sick leave days concerned, being provided by his or her employer
with a sick leave scheme under the Act of 2022, other than the first
3 days of payment under such scheme.”.

Amendment of section 69 of Principal Act (occupational injuries benefits) - calculation of
period in definition of “injury benefit period”

27. Section 69 of the Principal Act is amended, by the insertion of the following subsection
after subsection (1):

“(1A) For the purpose of calculating the period of 156 days in the definition
of ‘injury benefit period’ in relation to an accident, the following days
shall, in addition to any period since the accident concerned, be
included in the calculation:

(a) any statutory sick leave days under the Act of 2022;

(b) any day in respect of which the person, where he or she is
otherwise entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 is,
instead of and in substitution for that entitlement to the statutory
sick leave days concerned, being provided by his or her employer
with a sick leave scheme under the Act of 2022.”.

Occupational injuries benefits

28.  Section 74 of the Principal Act is amended, by the insertion of the following subsections
after subsection (2B):

“(2C) Notwithstanding subsections (2), (2A) and (2B), a person shall not be
entitled to injury benefit—

(a) for any day in respect of which the person is entitled to statutory
sick leave under the Act of 2022, or

(b) for any day in respect of which the person, where he or she is
otherwise entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 is,
instead of and in substitution for that entitlement to the statutory
sick leave days concerned, being provided by his or her employer
with a sick leave scheme under the Act of 2022.

15



Pt1.3 S.28 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(2D) Subsection (2C) shall not apply in a case where an exemption is for
the time being in force under section 10 of the Act of 2022 in respect
of the employer of the person concerned.

(2E) Notwithstanding subsections (2), (2A), (2B) and (2C), a person shall
not be entitled to injury benefit for the first day of any such
entitlement, where in the immediately preceding 6 days, the person is
entitled to statutory sick leave under the Act of 2022 in respect of a
Sunday.”.

PART 4

StatE PENSION (CONTRIBUTORY) — LONG-TERM CARER’S QUALIFYING CONTRIBUTION AND DEFERRAL OF
STATE PENSION (CONTRIBUTORY)

Amendment of section 2 of Principal Act
29. Section 2(1) of the Principal Act is amended—

(a) by the substitution of the following definition for the definition of “insurable
employment”:

“ ‘insurable employment’ means employment such that—
(a) a person, over the age of 16 years and under pensionable age, or

(b) a person born on or after 1 January 1958, who has attained
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor
been awarded a State pension (contributory),

employed in that employment would be an employed contributor;”,
and
(b) by the insertion of the following definitions:

“ ‘age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)’ has the meaning
given to it by section 108;

‘long-term carer’s qualifying contribution’ has the meaning given to it
by section 108A;”.

Amendment of section 12 of Principal Act (employed contributors and insured persons)

30. Section 12(1) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (a):

“(a) subject to paragraph (b), every person—

(i) over the age of 16 years and under pensionable age, or

16



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.4 S.30
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(i1) born on or after 1 January 1958, who has attained pensionable
age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor been
awarded a State pension (contributory),

who is employed in any of the employments specified in Part 1 of
Schedule 1, not being an employment specified in Part 2 of that
Schedule, shall be an employed contributor for the purposes of this
Act, and”.

Amendment of section 13 of Principal Act (employment contributions)

31. Section 13(4B) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (a):

“(a) deemed to be an employed contributor, where that person—

(1) having attained the age of 16 years and not having attained
pensionable age, or

ii) being a person born on or after 1 January 1958 who has attained
gap y
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor
been awarded a State pension (contributory),

is no longer employed in an employment specified in Part 1 of
Schedule 1, not being an employment specified in Part 2 of that
Schedule, and”.

Amendment of section 20 of Principal Act (self-employed contributors and insured
persons)

32. Section 20(1) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (a):
“(a) every person—

(1) over the age of 16 years and under pensionable age, or

(i1) born on or after 1 January 1958, who has attained pensionable
age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor been
awarded a State pension (contributory),

(not being a person included in any of the classes of person
specified in Part 3 of Schedule 1) who has reckonable income or
reckonable emoluments, shall be a self-employed contributor for
the purposes of this Act regardless of whether the person is also an
employed contributor,”.

Amendment of section 24 of Principal Act (voluntary contributors)

33. Section 24 of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
subsection for subsection (1):

17



Pr1.4 S.33 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

“(1) Subject to this Act, where a person ceases to be an employed
contributor or a self-employed contributor—

(a) otherwise than by reason of attaining pensionable age, or

(b) otherwise than, in the case of a person born on or after 1 January
1958, by reason of having been awarded the State pension
(contributory) or attaining the age of 70 years,

and the person has qualifying contributions in respect of not less than
520 contribution weeks, he or she shall, on making application in the
prescribed manner and within the prescribed period, be entitled to
become an insured person paying contributions under this Act
voluntarily (in this Act referred to as ‘a voluntary contributor’).”.

Amendment of section 25 of Principal Act (voluntary contributions by former employed
contributors)

34. Section 25(1) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (a):

“(a) a contribution (in this Act referred to as a ‘voluntary contribution”),
in the case of—

(i) a person who becomes a voluntary contributor by virtue of
section 24(1)(a) and who is under pensionable age, or

(ii)) a person born on or after 1 January 1958 who has attained
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor
been awarded a State pension (contributory),

shall be payable in each contribution year, at the time or times and
in the manner that the Minister shall prescribe, at a percentage rate,
as set out in paragraph (b), of the amount of the reckonable income
(if any) of the contributor in the preceding contribution year or in
an amount (‘minimum annual amount’), as set out in paragraph (b),
whichever is the greater.”.

Amendment of section 40 of Principal Act (entitlement to illness benefit)

35. Section 40(1) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (a):

“(a) on the day for which the benefit is claimed—
(i) the person is under pensionable age, or

(i1) the person was born on or after 1 January 1958 and has attained
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor
been awarded a State pension (contributory),”.

18



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] Pr.4
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

Amendment of section 44 of Principal Act (duration of illness benefit)

36. Section 44 of the Principal Act is amended, by the insertion of the following subsection
after subsection (10):

“(11) Where a person is in receipt of illness benefit immediately prior to
attaining pensionable age, payment of that benefit shall cease upon
him or her attaining pensionable age unless he or she—

(a) was born on or after 1 January 1958, and

(b) has, in the prescribed manner and within the prescribed period,
notified the Minister of his or her desire to continue receiving
illness benefit after attaining pensionable age for any remaining
period in which he or she is entitled to receive it.”.

Amendment of section 46A of Principal Act (entitlement to partial capacity benefit)
37. Section 46A(1) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (d):

“(d) (i) is under pensionable age, or

(i) (I) was born on or after 1 January 1958 and has attained
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years
nor been awarded a State pension (contributory), and

(IT) satisfies the requirement of clause (I) of subparagraph (i) of
paragraph (c).”.

Amendment of section 46C of Principal Act (duration of partial capacity benefit)

38.  Section 46C of the Principal Act is amended, by the insertion of the following subsection
after subsection (4):

“(5) Where a person is in receipt of partial capacity benefit immediately
prior to attaining pensionable age, payment of that benefit shall cease
upon him or her attaining pensionable age unless he or she—

(a) was born on or after 1 January 1958,

(b) is in receipt of partial capacity benefit by reason of having satisfied
the requirement of section 46A(1)(c)(i)(I), and

(c) has, in the prescribed manner and within the prescribed period,
notified the Minister of his or her desire to continue receiving
partial capacity benefit after attaining pensionable age for any
remaining period in which he or she is entitled to receive it.”.

Amendment of section 62 of Principal Act (entitlement to jobseeker’s benefit)

39. Section 62(1) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (a):

19



P1.4 S.39 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

“(a) on the day for which the benefit is claimed he or she—
(i) is under pensionable age, or

(i1) is a person born on or after 1 January 1958, who has attained
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor
been awarded a State pension (contributory),”.

Amendment of section 64 of Principal Act (conditions for receipt of jobseeker’s benefit)

40. Section 64(4) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of “70 years of age” for
“65 years of age”.

Amendment of section 67 of Principal Act (duration of payment of jobseeker’s benefit)
41. Section 67 of the Principal Act is amended—

(a) in subsection (1), by the insertion of “and under pensionable age” after “over 65
years of age”, and

(b) by the insertion of the following subsection after subsection (10):

“(11) Where a person is in receipt of jobseeker’s benefit immediately prior
to attaining pensionable age, payment of that benefit shall cease upon
him or her attaining pensionable age unless he or she—

(a) was born on or after 1 January 1958, and

(b) has, in the prescribed manner and within the prescribed period,
notified the Minister of his or her desire to continue receiving
jobseeker’s benefit after attaining pensionable age for any
remaining period in which he or she is entitled to receive it.”.

Amendment of section 68C of Principal Act (entitlement to jobseeker’s benefit
(self-employed))
42. Section 68C(1) of the Principal Act is amended, by the substitution of the following
paragraph for paragraph (a):
“(a) in the week for which the benefit is claimed he or she—

(i) is under pensionable age, or

(i) is a person born on or after 1 January 1958, who has attained
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor
been awarded a State pension (contributory),”.

Amendment of section 68H of Principal Act (duration of jobseeker’s benefit
(self-employed))
43.  Section 68H of the Principal Act is amended—

20



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.4 S.43
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(a) in subsection (6), by the insertion of “until he or she reaches pensionable age”
after “shall continue to be entitled to that benefit”, and

(b) by the insertion of the following subsection after subsection (6):

“(7) Where a person is in receipt of jobseeker’s benefit (self-employed)
immediately prior to attaining pensionable age, payment of that benefit
shall cease upon him or her attaining pensionable age unless he or
she—

(a) was born on or after 1 January 1958, and

(b) has, in the prescribed manner and within the prescribed period,
notified the Minister of his or her desire to continue receiving
jobseeker’s benefit (self-employed) after attaining pensionable age
for any remaining period in which he or she is entitled to receive
it.”.

Amendment of section 108 of Principal Act (entitlement to State pension (contributory))
44. Section 108 of the Principal Act is amended—

(a) by the substitution of the following subsection for subsection (1):

“(1) Subject to this Act, a person shall be entitled to State pension
(contributory) where he or she—

(a) has applied for that benefit in the prescribed manner,

(b) has attained pensionable age or deferred pensionable age, as the
case may be, and

(c) satisfies the contribution conditions in section 109.”,
(b) by the insertion of the following subsections after subsection (1):

“(1A) Subject to subsection (1), a person who has attained the age of 66
years shall be entitled to State pension (contributory) payable at the
age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) for age 66 years.

(1B) Subject to subsections (1) and (1C), a person born on or after 1
January 1958—

(a) who has attained the age of 67 years, and has never been awarded a
State pension (contributory), shall be entitled to State pension
(contributory) payable at the age referenced rate of State pension
(contributory) for age 67 years,

(b) who has attained the age of 68 years, and has never been awarded a
State pension (contributory), shall be entitled to State pension
(contributory) payable at the age referenced rate of State pension
(contributory) for age 68 years,

21



Pr.4 S.44 [No. 37.]

Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(c) who has attained the age of 69 years, and has never been awarded a
State pension (contributory), shall be entitled to State pension
(contributory) payable at the age referenced rate of State pension
(contributory) for age 69 years, and

(d) who has attained the age of 70 years, and has never been awarded a
State pension (contributory), shall be entitled to State pension
(contributory) payable at the age referenced rate of State pension
(contributory) for age 70 years.

(1C) A person shall not be entitled to the age referenced rate of State

pension (contributory) payable for his or her age at the date of his or
her claim, except to the extent specified in subsection (1B) of
section 109 where, having attained pensionable age, the person is or
has been in receipt of a specified weekly payment.”,

(c) in subsection (2)—

(1) by the insertion of the following definitions:

13

‘age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)’ means the rate
of State pension (contributory) specified in Part 1 of Schedule 2
applicable for a claimant’s age, which, on satisfying the contribution
conditions set out in section 109, is payable to a claimant upon
attaining pensionable age or deferred pensionable age, as the case may
be, and once an age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) has
been so awarded to a claimant, that rate shall remain payable to the
claimant concerned for the remaining period of his or her claim;

‘deferred pensionable age’ means, in relation to a person born on or
after 1 January 1958 who has attained pensionable age—

(a) the age at which he or she is awarded a State pension
(contributory), or

(b) the age of 70 years,

whichever is the lesser age and, in any event, does not apply to a
person born on or before 31 December 1957;

‘qualifying contribution’ other than in respect of a specified
contribution week, includes a long-term carer’s qualifying
contribution;

‘specified contribution week’ means a contribution week where the
claimant received employment contributions at the rate specified in
Article 81(2)(a), 82(2)(a) or 83(2)(a) of the Regulations of 1996 and
was attributed with a long-term carer’s qualifying contribution in
respect of that contribution week;

‘specified weekly payment” means a payment specified in Schedule
5A;

22



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.4 S.44
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

‘yearly average approach’ means the rate of State pension
(contributory) to which a claimant would be entitled to on the basis of
the claimant’s yearly average or alternative yearly average whichever
i1s more favourable to him or her;”,

(i1) in the definition of “home caring period”—

(D by the substitution of “on or after 1 September 2012, or deferred
pensionable age on or after 1 January 2024, as the case may be,” for “on
or after 1 September 2012,”,

(II) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be,” for “pensionable age”, and

(ITI) by the substitution of the following paragraph for paragraph (b):

“(b) he or she was not engaged in remunerative employment, other than
employment specified in paragraph 5 of Part 2 of Schedule 1, or he
or she does not have a qualifying contribution or a credited or
voluntary contribution reckonable (‘contribution reckonable’) for
State pension (contributory) purposes,”,

(iii) in paragraph (a) of the definition of “homemaker”, by the insertion of “or
deferred pensionable age, as the case may be” after “pensionable age”,

(iv) in the definition of “yearly average”, by the insertion of “or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be” after “pensionable age”, and

(v) in the definition of “alternative yearly average”, by the insertion of “or
deferred pensionable age, as the case may be,” after “pensionable age”,

(d) in subsection (4), in the definition of “relevant person”—
(i) in paragraph (a), by the substitution of “1991,” for “1991, or”,
(i1) in paragraph (b)(ii), by the substitution of “her, or” for “her.”, and
(iii) by the insertion of the following paragraph after paragraph (b):

“(c) a person who is not a relevant person by virtue of subparagraph (i)
or (i1) of paragraph (a) but who—

(1) in the case of a person who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, on or after 1 January 2024,
has long-term carer’s qualifying contributions attributed in
accordance with section 108A on the date of the person’s claim,
and

(i1) in the case of a person who attained pensionable age prior to 1
January 2024, had long-term carer’s qualifying contributions
attributed in accordance with section 108A.”,

and

(e) by the substitution of the following subsection for subsection (5):

23



Pr1.4 S.44 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

“(5) For the purpose of this Chapter, in the case of a relevant person, ‘entry
into insurance’ means, subject to subsection (8)—

(a) in relation to a person—

(i) the date on which the person becomes an insured person for the
first time by virtue of section 12(1), except where he or she
becomes an insured person by virtue of paragraph (b) of
section 12(1) only, or

(i1) the date on which he or she becomes an insured person for the
first time by virtue of section 20,

whichever of subparagraph (i) or (ii) first occurs and, subject to
paragraph (b), that date shall be regarded as the date of entry into
insurance for the purposes of section 109(1), and

(b) in relation to a person in relation to whom long-term carer’s
qualifying contributions were attributed in accordance with
section 108A, the date of the first of such contributions or, if
applicable to that person, the date on which he or she first becomes
a person to whom subparagraph (i) or (ii) of paragraph (a) applies,
whichever first occurs.”.

Long-term carer’s qualifying contribution
45.  The Principal Act is amended by the insertion of the following section after section 108:
“108A. (1) A contribution (in this Act referred to as a ‘long-term carer’s
qualifying contribution’) shall be attributed to a person for State

pension (contributory) purposes, where, in respect of not less than
1,040 contribution weeks—

(a) he or she had attained the age of 16 years but had not attained
pensionable age or deferred pensionable age, as the case may be,
and—

(1) was resident in the State, or
(i) was a person referred to in section 219(2),

(b) he or she was not engaged in insurable employment or
self-employment other than employment specified in paragraph 5
of Part 2 of Schedule 1 for State pension (contributory) purposes,

(c) he or she—

(1) was residing with and providing full-time care and attention to a
relevant person or a qualified child, or

(i1) subject to the conditions and in the circumstances that may be
prescribed, was not residing with but was providing full-time
care and attention to a relevant person,

24



[2023.]

Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.4 S.45
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(d) he or she was not in receipt of—

(1) a weekly payment under this Act disallowed for the purposes of
this paragraph in accordance with regulations under
subsection (4), or

(i1)) a weekly payment under this Act, other than a payment referred
to in subparagraph (i), unless he or she was also in receipt of
carer’s benefit or carer’s allowance,

and

(e) he or she applies to have such contribution weeks attributed as
long-term carer’s qualifying contributions, whereby contributions
may be attributed from 1 January 2024 to a person who complies
with this section and—

(i) was born on or after 1 January 1958 and has attained
pensionable age or deferred pensionable age, as the case may
be, or

(i1) attained pensionable age prior to 1 January 2024, in which case
contributions may be attributed only in respect of such periods
as were completed before he or she attained pensionable age.

(2) For the purposes of subsection (1)(b), a person who—
(a) engages in insurable employment,
(b) engages in self-employment, or

(c) undertakes such training or courses of education as the Minister
may, from time to time determine,

shall not be regarded as engaging in insurable employment or
self-employment where the aggregate duration of the activities
referred to in paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) does not exceed 18 and a half
hours in accordance with Regulations made under section 100(3),
179(2) or 186A(6).

(3) The question as to whether a person satisfies the criteria set out in
subsection (1), or regulations under subsection (4), is a question that
may be decided by a deciding officer.

(4) The Minister may, by regulations, make provision for the conditions
required to be satisfied in order to qualify for long-term carer’s
qualifying contributions and, notwithstanding the generality of the
foregoing, any such regulations may provide for—

(a) the circumstances in which a person may be regarded as providing
full-time care and attention to a relevant person or a qualified child,

(b) the manner in which an application may be made under this
section, including by electronic means,

25



Pr1.4 S.45 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(c) any additional evidence that may be offered by a person to
demonstrate the nature, extent and duration of the care provided,
including information or documentation to be provided by the
person in support of the application,

(d) any weekly payments under this Act that shall be disallowed for the
purposes of subsection (1)(d), or

(e) such other matters as the Minister considers appropriate for the
purposes of this section.

(5) Nothing in this section, or any other provision of this Act, shall be
construed as attributing a long-term carer’s qualifying contribution to a
person where that person complied with paragraphs (a) to (e) of
subsection (1) in respect of less than 1,040 contribution weeks.

(6) In this section—

‘qualified child’ means a qualified child within the meaning of
section 186C;

‘relevant person’ means a relevant person within the meaning of
section 224(2).”.

Amendment of section 109 of Principal Act (conditions for receipt of State pension
(contributory))

46. Section 109 of the Principal Act is amended—
(a) in subsection (1)—
(i) by the substitution of the following paragraph for paragraph (a):

“(a) subject to subsection (3), that the claimant has entered into
insurance at least 10 years before attaining pensionable age or
deferred pensionable age, as the case may be,”,

and

(i) in paragraph (c), by the substitution of “subject to subsection (6D), that the
claimant” for “that the claimant”,

(b) by the insertion of the following subsection after subsection (1A):

“(1B) (a) In the case of a claimant to whom section 108(1C) applies, who is,
during the relevant period, in receipt of a specified weekly
payment, the period or aggregate of periods during which he or she
is in receipt of such a specified weekly payment shall be regarded
as reducing his or her deferred pensionable age by the equivalent
period or aggregate of periods, measured in days, that he or she was
in receipt of such a specified weekly payment and the age
referenced rate of State pension (contributory) shall be calculated
accordingly.

26



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.4 S.46
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(b) In this subsection, ‘relevant period’ means the period beginning on
the date on which the claimant attains pensionable age and ending
on the date on which he or she was first awarded State pension
(contributory).”,

(c) in subsection (6A) by the substitution of “Subject to subsection (6D), in the case
of” for “In the case of”,

(d) in paragraph (a) of subsection (6B), by the substitution of “Schedule 2 or, if
having attained deferred pensionable age, the age referenced rate of State pension
(contributory) appropriate to that deferred pensionable age, if eligible,” for
“Schedule 27,

(e) by the insertion of the following subsection after subsection (6C):

“(6D) Notwithstanding any other provision in this Chapter, the rate of State
pension (contributory) payable to a claimant who attains pensionable
age or deferred pensionable age, as the case may be, on or after 1
January 2025 shall be calculated as follows:

(a) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2025 and
31 December 2025, either—

(1) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(I) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 90 per cent, and

(II) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 10 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

(b) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2026 and
31 December 2026, either—

(1) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(D) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 80 per cent, and

27



P1.4 S.46 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(I) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 20 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

(c) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2027 and
31 December 2027, either—

(i) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(D) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 70 per cent, and

(I) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 30 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

(d) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2028 and
31 December 2028, either—

(i) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(D) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 60 per cent, and

(II) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 40 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

(e) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2029 and
31 December 2029, either—

(i) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

28



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.4 S.46
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(i1) the aggregate of—

(I) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 50 per cent, and

(I) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 50 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

(f) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2030 and
31 December 2030, either—

(i) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(D) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 40 per cent, and

(I) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 60 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

(g) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2031 and
31 December 2031, either—

(i) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(D) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 30 per cent, and

(II) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 70 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

29



P1.4 S.46 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(h) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2032 and
31 December 2032, either—

(1) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(D) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 20 per cent, and

(I) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 80 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant;

(i) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, between 1 January 2033 and
31 December 2033, either—

(i) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory) payable
to the claimant calculated according to the aggregated
contributions method, or

(i1) the aggregate of—

(D) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
yearly average approach multiplied by 10 per cent, and

(II) the age referenced rate of State pension (contributory)
payable to the claimant, calculated in accordance with the
aggregated contributions method multiplied by 90 per cent,

whichever is the more favourable to that claimant; and

(j) in the case of a claimant who attains pensionable age or deferred
pensionable age, as the case may be, on or after 1 January 2034,
solely in accordance with the aggregated contributions method.”,

and
(f) in subsection (17)(a)—
(i) in subparagraph (iii), by the substitution of “purposes,” for “purposes, and”,

(i1) in subparagraph (iv), by the substitution of “subsection (6A), and” for
“subsection (6A)”, and

(iii) by the insertion of the following subparagraph after subparagraph (iv):

30



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] P1.4 S.46
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

“(v) long-term carer’s qualifying contributions attributable to him or
her which are reckonable for State pension (contributory),”.

Amendment of section 110 of Principal Act

47. Section 110 of the Principal Act is amended, in subsection (1)(a), by the substitution of
“pensionable age or deferred pensionable age, as the case may be,” for “pensionable

2

age”.

Rate of pension
48. The Principal Act is amended by the substitution of the following section for section 111:

“Rate of Pension
111. Subject to this Part, the weekly rate of State pension (contributory)—

(a) at the age referenced rate for age 66 years,
(b) at the age referenced rate for age 67 years,
(c) at the age referenced rate for age 68 years,
(d) at the age referenced rate for age 69 years, and
(e) at the age referenced rate for age 70 years,

shall be as set out in column (2) of Part 1 of Schedule 2.”.

Amendment of section 113A of Principal Act

49. Section 113A of the Principal Act is amended, in subsection (3), by the substitution of “in
accordance with the age referenced rate for age 66 years specified in section 111.” for “in
accordance with the rate specified in section 111.”.

Amendment of section 238B of Principal Act (entitlement to back to work family
dividend)
50. Section 238B(1) of the Principal Act is amended—

(a) by the deletion of “who has not attained pensionable age”,

(b) in paragraph (b), by the substitution of “subparagraph (i),” for “subparagraph (i),
and”,

(¢) in paragraph (c), by the substitution of “immediately before that date, and” for
“immediately before that date.”, and

(d) by the insertion of the following paragraph after paragraph (c):
“(d) he or she—

(i) is under pensionable age, or

31



Pr.4 S.50 [No. 37.]

Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(i) is a person born on or after 1 January 1958 who has attained
pensionable age but has neither attained the age of 70 years nor
been awarded a State pension (contributory).”.

Amendment of section 238C of Principal Act (duration of back to work family dividend)

51.

Section 238C of the Principal Act is amended, by the insertion of the following

subsection after subsection (3):

“(4)

Where a person was in receipt of back to work family dividend
immediately prior to attaining pensionable age, payment of that
dividend shall cease upon him or her attaining pensionable age unless
he or she—

(a) was born on or after 1 January 1958, and

(b) has, in the prescribed manner and within the prescribed period,
notified the Minister of his or her desire to continue receiving back
to work family dividend after attaining pensionable age for any
remaining period in which he or she is entitled to receive it.”.

Amendment of Part 1 of Schedule 2 to Principal Act

52.

(1) The Principal Act is amended, in Part 1 of Schedule 2 (amended by section 17), by the

insertion of the following references after reference 3(a)(ii):

(b)(i) Age
referenced
rate for age
67 years
(i1)
Additional
increase for
a qualified
adult who
has attained
pensionable
age

(©)(i) Age
referenced
rate for age
68 years
(i1)
Additional
increase for
a qualified
adult who
has attained
pensionable
age

290.30

304.80

193.40 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00
66.90 - - - - -
203.00 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00
70.20 - - - - -

32



[2023.]

(d)(i) Age
referenced
rate for age
69 years
(i1)
Additional
increase for
a qualified
adult who
has attained
pensionable
age

(©)(i) Age
referenced
rate for age
70 years
(i1)
Additional
increase for
a qualified
adult who
has attained
pensionable
age

320.30

337.20

Social Welfare
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

[No. 37.] P14 S.52

213.30 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00

73.80 - - - - -

224.60 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00

77.70 - - - - -

2

(2) This section comes into operation on 6 January 2024.

Specified weekly payments

53.

Schedule 5:

The Principal Act is amended, by the insertion of the following Schedule after

“SCHEDULE 5A

Section 108(2)

1.

SpecIFIED WEEKLY PAYMENTS

Each of the following payments shall be a specified weekly payment
for the purposes of this Schedule and Chapter 15 of Part 2:

(a) jobseeker’s benefit;

(b) jobseeker’s benefit (self-employed);
(c) illness benefit;

(d) State pension (non-contributory);

(e) occupational injuries benefit comprising
disablement benefit and death benefit;

injury  benefit,

(f) carer’s benefit;

33



Pr1.4 S.53 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(g) carer’s allowance;

(h) weekly supplementary welfare allowance known as basic
supplementary welfare allowance;

(i) a payment made under a scheme provided for under the European
Communities (Reception Conditions) Regulations 2018 (S.I. No.
230 of 2018) administered by the Minister and known as the
‘daily expenses allowance’;

(j) widow’s (contributory) pension, widower’s (contributory) pension
and surviving civil partner’s (contributory) pension;

(k) a payment to a person who is or becomes a person in respect of
whom an increase for a qualified adult is being paid.

2. The Minister may by regulations amend paragraph 1 by adding a
specified weekly payment to, deleting a specified weekly payment
from, or amending a reference to a specified weekly payment in, that
paragraph.”.

34



[2023.]

Section 17

Social Welfare

(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

SCHEDULE 1

[No. 37.]

SociaL INsurance BeneriTs (NEw RATES) - SuBsTiTUTION OF PARTS 1 TO 4 OF SCHEDULE 2

“Part 1

RATES oF PERIODICAL BENEFITS AND INCREASES

35

Description | Weekly | Increase | Increase | Increase | Increase | Increase| Increase
of benefit rate for for each | for each where where | where the
qualified| qualified| qualified the the person is
adult child child personis| person | ordinarily
(where aged aged 12 living has resident
payable) | under 12 years alone attained on an
years and over | (where the age | island off
(where (where | payable) of 80 the coast
payable) | payable) years of Ireland
(where (where
payable) | payable)
&) ) 3) “ ) (6) (7 ®)
€ € € € € € €
1. Illness 232.00 | 154.00 46.00 54.00 - - -
Benefit,
Jobseeker’s
Benefit,
Jobseeker’s
benefit
(Self-
employed),
Injury
Benefit and
Health and
Safety
Benefit
2. Death
Benefit:
(a) pension | 262.50 - 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00
payable to a
widow,
widower or
surviving
civil partner
(section 81)
additional 19.20 - - - - - -
increase for
a widow,




Sch.1 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

widower or
surviving
civil
partner
(under
section 81)
who has
attained
pensionable
age

(b) pension
payable to a
parent:

(1) reduced - - - - - - -
rate

(i1) - - - - - - -
maximum
rate

(c) pension | 218.80 - - - - - -
payable to
an orphan

3. State
Pension
(Contributo
ry):

(a)(i) Age 277.30 | 184.70 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00
referenced
rate for age
66 years

(ii) - 63.90 - - - - -
Additional
increase for
a qualified
adult who
has attained
pensionable
age

3A. State - - - - - - -
Pension
(Transition)

36



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] Scu.1
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

additional - - - - - - -
increase
where a
qualified
adult has
attained
pensionable
age before 2
January
2014

4. Invalidity | 237.50 169.70 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00
Pension:

additional - 78.90 - - - - -
increase
where a
qualified
adult has
attained
pensionable
age before 2
January
2014

5. Widow’s | 237.50 - 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00
(Contributo
ry) Pension,
Widower’s
(Contributo
ry) Pension
and
Surviving
Civil
Partner’s
(Contributo
ry) Pension
and a
payment
referred to
in
paragraph
(a) of the
definition
of ‘relevant
payment’ in
section
178(1):

37




Sch.1 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

additional 39.80 - - - - - R
increase for
a
beneficiary
who has
attained
pensionable
age

6. 215.00 - - - - - -
Guardian’s
Payment
(Contributo

ry)

7. Carer’s
Benefit:

(a) in the 249.00 - 46.00 54.00 - - -
case of a
person to
whom
section
102(1)(b)
applies

(b) in the 373.50 - 46.00 54.00 - - -
case of a
person to
whom
section
102(1)(a)
applies

ParT 2

OccuPATIONAL INJURIES BENEFITS - GRATUITIES AND GRANT

Description of Grant Amount

(1) 2

€

1. Disablement Benefit:
Maximum gratuity 18,400

2. Death Benefit 850

Part 3

38



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] Sch.1
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.
DisaBLEMENT PENSION
Degree of disablement Weekly rate
) 2
€
100 per cent 263.00
90 per cent 236.70
80 per cent 210.40
70 per cent 184.10
60 per cent 157.80
50 per cent 131.50
40 per cent 105.20
30 per cent 78.90
20 per cent 52.60
Part 4
INCREASES OF DISABLEMENT PENSION
Description |  Weekly Increase Increase Increase Increase Increase
of Increase Rate for for each for each where the | where the
qualified qualified qualified person is person is
adult child aged | child aged living ordinarily
(where under 12 12 years alone resident on
payable) years and over an island
(where (where off the
payable) payable) coast of
Ireland
(where
payable)
) 2 3 “ ©) (6) Q)
€ € € € € €
1. Increase 232.00 154.00 46.00 50.00 22.00 20.00
where the
person is
permanently
incapable of
work

39




Sch.1 [No. 37.]

additional
increase for
a beneficiary
who has
attained the
age of 66
years

additional
increase
where the
qualified
adult has
attained the
age of 66
years

2. Increase
where the
person
requires
constant
attendance

19.30

249.00

(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

12.80

Social Welfare

[2023.]

40

2




[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

SCHEDULE 2
Section 19

Sociar AssiSTANCE PAyMENTS (NEw RATES) - SusstiTUTION OF PARTS 1 TO 3 OF SCHEDULE 4

“Part 1

RATES OF PERIODICAL SOCIAL ASSISTANCE AND INCREASES

Description | Weekly | Increase | Increase | Increase | Increase | Increase| Increase
of benefit rate for for each | for each where where | where the
qualified| qualified| qualified the the person is
adult child child personis| person | ordinarily
(where aged aged 12 living has resident
payable) | under 12 years alone attained on an
years and over | (where the age | island off
(where (where | payable) of 80 the coast
payable) | payable) years of Ireland
(where (where
payable) | payable)
&) ) A3) 4 ) (6) (N ®)
€ € € € € € €
1.
Jobseeker’s
allowance:
(a) in the 232.00 | 154.00 46.00 54.00 - - -
case of a
person to
whom
section
142(1)(a)
applies
(b) in the 232.00 | 154.00 46.00 54.00 - - -
case of a
person to
whom
section
142(1)(b)
applies
(c) in the 141.70 | 141.70 - - - - -
case of a
person to
whom
section
142A
applies

41



Scu.2 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

2. Pre- - - - - - - -
Retirement
Allowance

3. Disability| 232.00 154.00 46.00 54.00 22.00 - 20.00
Allowance

4. State 266.00 175.70 46.00 54.00 22.00 10.00 20.00
Pension
(Non-
Contributor
y):

5. Blind 232.00 154.00 46.00 54.00 22.00 - 20.00
Pension

6. Widow’s | 232.00 - - - - - -
(Non-
Contributor
y) Pension,
Widower’s
(Non-
Contributor
y) Pension,
Surviving
Civil
Partner’s
(Non-
Contributor
y) Pension
and a
payment
referred to
in
paragraph
(b) or (¢) of
the
definition
of ‘relevant
payment’ in
section
178(1)

7. One- 232.00 - 46.00 54.00 - - -
Parent
Family
Payment

8. Carer’s
Allowance

42



[2023.] Social Welfare [No. 37.] Scu.2
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

(a) in the 372.00 - 46.00 54.00 - 10.00 20.00
case of a
person to
whom
section
181(1)(a)
applies
additional 57.00 - - - - - R
increase for
a
beneficiary
who has
attained
pensionable
age

(b) in the 248.00 - 46.00 54.00 - 10.00 20.00
case of a
person to
whom
section
181(1)(b)
applies

additional 38.00 - - - - - R
increase for
a
beneficiary
who has
attained
pensionable
age

9. 215.00 - - - - - -
Guardian’s
Payment
(Non-
Contributor
y)

10.
Supplement
ary Welfare
Allowance

(a) in the 230.00 154.00 46.00 54.00 - - -
case of a
person to
whom
section
197(1)
applies

43




Sch.2 [No. 37.] Social Welfare

(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

[2023.]

(b) in the
case of a
person to
whom
section
197(2)
applies

141.70 | 141.70 - - - - -

11. Farm 232.00 | 154.00 46.00 54.00 - - -

Assist

ParT 2

INcreases oF STATE PENSION (NoN-CoNTRIBUTORY) For ONE oF A CoUPLE WHERE
Sprousg, CiviL PARTNER OR COHABITANT OF THAT PERSON Has NoT ATTAINED PENSIONABLE

AGE
Means of claimant or pensioner Weekly rate of increase
(1) @)
€

Where the weekly means of the claimant or 175.70
pensioner do not exceed €30.00

exceed €30.00 but does not exceed €32.50 174.00
exceed €32.50 but does not exceed €35.00 172.40
exceed €35.00 but does not exceed €37.50 170.70
exceed €37.50 but does not exceed €40.00 169.10
exceed €40.00 but does not exceed €42.50 167.10
exceed €42.50 but does not exceed €45.00 165.80
exceed €45.00 but does not exceed €47.50 164.10
exceed €47.50 but does not exceed €50.00 162.50
exceed €50.00 but does not exceed €52.50 160.80
exceed €52.50 but does not exceed €55.00 159.20
exceed €55.00 but does not exceed €57.50 157.50
exceed €57.50 but does not exceed €60.00 155.90
exceed €60.00 but does not exceed €62.50 154.20
exceed €62.50 but does not exceed €65.00 152.60
exceed €65.00 but does not exceed €67.50 150.90
exceed €67.50 but does not exceed €70.00 149.30
exceed €70.00 but does not exceed €72.50 147.60
exceed €72.50 but does not exceed €75.00 146.00

44




[2023.] Social Welfare
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

exceed €75.00 but does not exceed €77.50
exceed €77.50 but does not exceed €80.00
exceed €80.00 but does not exceed €82.50
exceed €82.50 but does not exceed €85.00
exceed €85.00 but does not exceed €87.50
exceed €87.50 but does not exceed €90.00
exceed €90.00 but does not exceed €92.50
exceed €92.50 but does not exceed €95.00
exceed €95.00 but does not exceed €97.50
exceed €97.50 but does not exceed €100.00
exceed €100.00 but does not exceed €102.50
exceed €102.50 but does not exceed €105.00
exceed €105.00 but does not exceed €107.50
exceed €107.50 but does not exceed €110.00
exceed €110.00 but does not exceed €112.50
exceed €112.50 but does not exceed €115.00
exceed €115.00 but does not exceed €117.50
exceed €117.50 but does not exceed €120.00
exceed €120.00 but does not exceed €122.50
exceed €122.50 but does not exceed €125.00
exceed €125.00 but does not exceed €127.50
exceed €127.50 but does not exceed €130.00
exceed €130.00 but does not exceed €132.50
exceed €132.50 but does not exceed €135.00
exceed €135.00 but does not exceed €137.50
exceed €137.50 but does not exceed €140.00
exceed €140.00 but does not exceed €142.50
exceed €142.50 but does not exceed €145.00
exceed €145.00 but does not exceed €147.50
exceed €147.50 but does not exceed €150.00
exceed €150.00 but does not exceed €152.50
exceed €152.50 but does not exceed €155.00
exceed €155.00 but does not exceed €157.50
exceed €157.50 but does not exceed €160.00
exceed €160.00 but does not exceed €162.50
exceed €162.50 but does not exceed €165.00

45

144.30
142.70
141.00
139.40
137.70
136.10
134.40
132.80
131.10
129.50
127.80
126.20
124.50
122.90
121.20
119.60
117.90
116.30
114.60
113.00
111.30
109.60
108.00
106.30
104.70
103.00
101.00
99.70

98.10

96.40

94.80

93.10

91.50

89.80

88.20

86.50

[No. 37.] Scu.2




Sch.2 [No. 37.] Social Welfare
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

exceed €165.00 but does not exceed €167.50
exceed €167.50 but does not exceed €170.00
exceed €170.00 but does not exceed €172.50
exceed €172.50 but does not exceed €175.00
exceed €175.00 but does not exceed €177.50
exceed €177.50 but does not exceed €180.00
exceed €180.00 but does not exceed €182.50
exceed €182.50 but does not exceed €185.00
exceed €185.00 but does not exceed €187.50
exceed €187.50 but does not exceed €190.00
exceed €190.00 but does not exceed €192.50
exceed €192.50 but does not exceed €195.00
exceed €195.00 but does not exceed €197.50
exceed €197.50 but does not exceed €200.00
exceed €200.00 but does not exceed €202.50
exceed €202.50 but does not exceed €205.00
exceed €205.00 but does not exceed €207.50
exceed €207.50 but does not exceed €210.00
exceed €210.00 but does not exceed €212.50
exceed €212.50 but does not exceed €215.00
exceed €215.00 but does not exceed €217.50
exceed €217.50 but does not exceed €220.00
exceed €220.00 but does not exceed €222.50
exceed €222.50 but does not exceed €225.00
exceed €225.00 but does not exceed €227.50
exceed €227.50 but does not exceed €230.00
exceed €230.00 but does not exceed €232.50
exceed €232.50 but does not exceed €235.00
exceed €235.00 but does not exceed €237.50
exceed €237.50 but does not exceed €240.00
exceed €240.00 but does not exceed €242.50
exceed €242.50 but does not exceed €245.00
exceed €245.00 but does not exceed €247.50
exceed €247.50 but does not exceed €250.00
exceed €250.00 but does not exceed €252.50
exceed €252.50 but does not exceed €255.00

46

84.90
83.20
81.60
79.90
78.30
76.60
75.00
73.30
71.70
70.00
68.40
66.70
65.10
63.40
61.80
60.10
58.50
56.80
55.20
53.50
51.90
50.20
48.50
46.90
45.20
43.60
41.90
40.30
38.60
37.00
35.30
33.70
32.00
30.40
28.70
27.10

[2023.]




[2023.] Social Welfare

[No. 37.] Scu.2

(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

exceed €255.00 but does not exceed €257.50
exceed €257.50 but does not exceed €260.00
exceed €260.00 but does not exceed €262.50
exceed €262.50 but does not exceed €265.00
exceed €265.00 but does not exceed €267.50
exceed €267.50 but does not exceed €270.00
exceed €270.00 but does not exceed €272.50
exceed €272.50 but does not exceed €275.00
exceed €275.00 but does not exceed €277.50
exceed €277.50 but does not exceed €280.00
exceed €280.00 but does not exceed €282.50
exceed €282.50 but does not exceed €285.00
exceed €285.00 but does not exceed €287.50
exceed €287.50 but does not exceed €290.00
exceed €290.00 but does not exceed €292.50
exceed €292.50

25.40
23.80
22.10
20.50
18.80
17.20
15.50
13.90
12.20
10.60
8.90
7.30
5.60
4.00
2.30
Nil

Increase oF BLinD PensioN For ONE oF A CoupLE WHERE SPoUSE, CIviL PARTNER OR
CoHABITANT OF THAT PERSON Has NoT ATTAINED PENSIONABLE AGE

Means of claimant or pensioner

Weekly rate of increase

) )

€
Where the weekly means of the claimant or 154.00

pensioner do not exceed €7.60

exceed €7.60 but do not exceed €10.10 152.30
exceed €10.10 but do not exceed €12.60 150.70
exceed €12.60 but do not exceed €15.10 149.00
exceed €15.10 but do not exceed €17.60 147.40
exceed €17.60 but do not exceed €20.10 145.70
exceed €20.10 but do not exceed €22.60 144.00
exceed €22.60 but do not exceed €25.10 142.40
exceed €25.10 but do not exceed €27.60 140.70
exceed €27.60 but do not exceed €30.10 139.10
exceed €30.10 but do not exceed €32.60 137.40
exceed €32.60 but do not exceed €35.10 135.70

47




Sch.2 [No. 37.] Social Welfare
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

exceed €35.10 but do not exceed €37.60
exceed €37.60 but do not exceed €40.10
exceed €40.10 but do not exceed €43.60
exceed €43.60 but do not exceed €45.10
exceed €45.10 but do not exceed €47.60
exceed €47.60 but do not exceed €50.10
exceed €50.10 but do not exceed €52.60
exceed €52.60 but do not exceed €55.10
exceed €55.10 but do not exceed €57.60
exceed €57.60 but do not exceed €60.10
exceed €60.10 but do not exceed €62.60
exceed €62.60 but do not exceed €65.10
exceed €65.10 but do not exceed €67.60
exceed €67.60 but do not exceed €70.10
exceed €70.10 but do not exceed €72.60
exceed €72.60 but do not exceed €75.10
exceed €75.10 but do not exceed €77.60
exceed €77.60 but do not exceed €80.10
exceed €80.10 but do not exceed €82.60
exceed €82.60 but do not exceed €85.10
exceed €85.10 but do not exceed €87.60
exceed €87.60 but do not exceed €90.10
exceed €90.10 but do not exceed €92.60
exceed €92.60 but do not exceed €95.10
exceed €95.10 but do not exceed €97.60
exceed €97.60 but do not exceed €100.10
exceed €100.10 but do not exceed €102.60
exceed €102.60 but do not exceed €105.10
exceed €105.10 but do not exceed €107.60
exceed €107.60 but do not exceed €110.10
exceed €110.10 but do not exceed €112.60
exceed €112.60 but do not exceed €115.10
exceed €115.10 but do not exceed €117.60
exceed €117.60 but do not exceed €120.10
exceed €120.10 but do not exceed €122.60
exceed €122.60 but do not exceed €125.10

48

134.10
132.40
130.80
129.10
127.40
125.80
124.10
122.50
120.80
119.20
117.50
115.80
114.20
112.50
110.90
109.20
107.50
105.90
104.20
102.60
100.90
99.20
97.60
95.90
94.30
92.60
90.90
89.30
87.60
86.00
84.30
82.60
81.00
79.30
77.70
76.00

[2023.]




[2023.] Social Welfare
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

exceed €125.10 but do not exceed €127.60
exceed €127.60 but do not exceed €130.10
exceed €130.10 but do not exceed €132.60
exceed €132.60 but do not exceed €135.10
exceed €135.10 but do not exceed €137.60
exceed €137.60 but do not exceed €140.10
exceed €140.10 but do not exceed €142.60
exceed €142.60 but do not exceed €145.10
exceed €145.10 but do not exceed €147.60
exceed €147.60 but do not exceed €150.10
exceed €150.10 but do not exceed €152.60
exceed €152.60 but do not exceed €155.10
exceed €155.10 but do not exceed €157.60
exceed €157.60 but do not exceed €160.10
exceed €160.10 but do not exceed €162.60
exceed €162.60 but do not exceed €165.10
exceed €165.10 but do not exceed €167.60
exceed €167.60 but do not exceed €170.10
exceed €170.10 but do not exceed €172.60
exceed €172.60 but do not exceed €175.10
exceed €175.10 but do not exceed €177.60
exceed €177.60 but do not exceed €180.10
exceed €180.10 but do not exceed €182.60
exceed €182.60 but do not exceed €185.10
exceed €185.10 but do not exceed €187.60
exceed €187.60 but do not exceed €190.10
exceed €190.10 but do not exceed €192.60
exceed €192.60 but do not exceed €195.10
exceed €195.10 but do not exceed €197.60
exceed €197.60 but do not exceed €200.10
exceed €200.10 but do not exceed €202.60
exceed €202.60 but do not exceed €205.10
exceed €205.10 but do not exceed €207.60
exceed €207.60 but do not exceed €210.10
exceed €210.10 but do not exceed €212.60
exceed €212.60 but do not exceed €215.10

49

74.30
72.70
71.00
69.40
67.70
66.00
64.00
62.70
61.10
59.40
57.80
56.10
54.40
52.80
51.10
49.50
47.80
46.10
44.50
42.80
41.20
39.50
37.80
36.20
34.50
32.90
31.20
29.50
27.90
26.20
24.60
22.90
21.20
19.60
17.90
16.30

[No. 37.] Scu.2




Scu.2 [No. 37.] Social Welfare [2023.]
(Miscellaneous Provisions) Act 2023.

exceed €215.10 but do not exceed €217.60 14.60
exceed €217.60 but do not exceed €220.10 12.90
exceed €220.10 but do not exceed €222.60 11.30
exceed €222.60 but do not exceed €225.10 9.60
exceed €225.10 but do not exceed €227.60 8.00
exceed €227.60 but do not exceed €230.10 6.30
exceed €230.10 but do not exceed €232.60 4.60
exceed €232.60 but do not exceed €235.10 3.00
exceed €235.10 Nil

2

50



